
 
MEMORANDUM 
To:  Liquor Commissioners 
 
From:  Tracey Covert, City Clerk 
 
Date:  July 1, 2013 
 
Re: Liquor Commission Hearing of July 9, 2013, located in Council Chambers, 109 E. 

Olive St. 
 
Public Comment 
 
4:00 p.m. 
 
 Request of Mark Mellor and Sarah Kelch to allow moderate consumption of 

alcohol at their November 7, 2013 wedding reception to be held at Miller Park 
Pavilion. 

 
 Request of Erik Nuesken and Becky Stolzenbach to allow moderate consumption 

of alcohol at their November 9, 2013 wedding reception to be held at Davis 
Lodge. 

 
 Request of Brian Smith and Ashley McKay to allow moderate consumption of 

alcohol at their June 28, 2014 wedding reception to be held at Davis Lodge. 
 
 The application of Bloomington Normal Jaycees, requesting a Limited Liquor 

License, (LB), liquor license which allows the sale of beer and wine only by the 
glass for consumption at the event called “Bruegala”, a charitable fundraiser to be 
held at the Bloomington Center for the Performing Arts (BCPA), located at 600 
N. East St., on Friday, August 23 & Saturday, August 24, 2013 from 5:00 to 
11:00 p.m. 

 
 The application of Station Two Twenty Inc., d/b/a Station Two Twenty located at 

220 E. Front St., requesting an RAPS liquor license which would allow the sale of 
all types of alcohol by the glass for consumption on the premises and the sale of 
all types packaged alcohol for consumption off seven (7) days a week. 

 
 The application of Ma Veharai, Inc., d/b/a Buddy’s Liquor, located at 806 S 

Eldorado St., requesting a TAPS liquor license which would allow the sale of all 
types of alcohol by the glass for consumption on the premises and the sale of all 
types packaged alcohol for consumption off the premises seven (7) days a week. 

 



 The application of Taste of India BLM, Inc., d/b/a Taste of India, located at 704 S 
Eldorado Rd., requesting an RAS liquor license which would allow the sale of all 
types of alcohol by the glass for consumption on the premises seven (7) days a 
week. 

 
  Notification of Member changes of Penalty Box Restaurants, LLC, d/b/a Baxter’s 

American Grille, located at 3212 E. Empire St., currently holding a RAPS liquor 
license which allows the sale of all types of alcohol by the glass for consumption 
on the premises and the sale of all types packaged alcohol for consumption off 
seven (7) days a week. 

 
  Notification of Board Officer change of Bloomington Country Club, d/b/a 

Bloomington Country Club, located at 605 Towanda Ave., currently holding a 
CAS liquor license which allows the sale of all types of alcohol by the glass for 
the consumption on the premises seven (7) days a week. 

 
 Notification of Change of Lodge officers’ positions from Loyal Order of Moose 

Bloomington Lodge 745, d/b/a Bloomington Moose #745, located at 614 IAA 
Dr., currently holding a CAS liquor license which allows the sale of all types of 
alcohol by the glass for consumption on the premises seven (7) days a week. 

 
  Notification of Board Member change of John H Kraus VFW Post #454, d/b/a 

John H Kraus VFW Post #454, located at 1006 E. Lincoln, currently holding a 
CAS liquor license which allows the sale of all types of alcohol by the glass for 
consumption on the premises seven (7) days a week. 

 
  Notification of University President change of Brd. of Trustees of Illinois State 

University, d/b/a Shakespeare Festival, located at 48 Sunset Rd., currently holding 
a Limited Liquor License, (LB) liquor license which allows the sale of beer and 
wine only by the glass for consumption at Illinois State University Foundation 
Ewing Cultural Center. 

 
  Application of AMIR 83, Inc., d/b/a Price Rite Food Mart, located at 706 N. 

Clinton, requesting a GPBS liquor license which would allow the sale of 
packaged beer and wine only for consumption off the premises seven (7) days a 
week. 

 
  Review of sanctions on Tjolo’s Corp., d/b/a Main Street Grill, located at 517 N. 

Main St., currently holding an RAS liquor license which allows the sale of all 
types of alcohol by the glass for consumption on the premises seven (7) days a 
week. 

 
Notification of Food and Beverage Tax Violation of Canambo, LLC, d/b/a Blue 
Line Night Club, located at 602 N. Main St., currently holding a TAS liquor 
license which allows the sale of all types of alcohol by the glass for consumption 
on the premises seven (7) days a week. 

 
 



 Proposed Text Amendment Chapter 6. Alcoholic Beverages. Section 3 Number of 
Licenses Limited – Applications. 

 
cc: Legal Dept. 
 Finance 
 
TC/rg 


